
 

Chair: Dr Clive Shaw 
Chief Officer: Fiona Clark 

 

Re: Freedom of Information Request 
 
Request/Response: 
 

1) How much did the CCG(s) spend on out of hours (GP) services in the first 11 months of    
2014? 
 
January – November (2014) - £1,211,000. 
 

2) How much did the CCG(s) spend on out of hours (GP) services in 2013?  
 
NHS South Sefton CCG came into existence on 1 April 2013. 
 
1 April - 31 December (2013) - £1,113,000. 

  
3) How much did the CCG(s) spend on out of hours (GP) services in 2012? 

 
NHS South Sefton CCG came into existence on 1 April 2013. The CCG does not hold 
information relating to the period prior to this date.  You may wish to redirect your request to 
the Department of Health Legacy team via the following link: 
reviewsandinformationteam@dh.gsi.gov.uk  
  

4) How many GPs were on duty between the hours of 7pm and 8am on a weekday in 2014? If 
this varies, please provide the figures for each month.  
 
NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information.  You may wish to redirect your 
request to the provider of the service; Go To Doc Ltd, who can be contacted via the 
following link: http://www.gtdhealthcare.co.uk/  
  

5) How many GPs were on duty on weekends in 2014? If this varies, please provide the 
figures for each month.  
 
Please redirect your request to the provider as per the information above. 
 

6) Do GPs receive any enhanced or overtime pay for working out of hours shifts? If so, please 
detail. 
 
Please redirect your request to the provider as per the information above. 
 

7) How many patients were registered in your area in 2014? 
 
Within NHS South Sefton CCG’s area there were 155,213 patients registered in 2014. 
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