NHS

South Sefton
Clinical Commissioning Group

Our ref: FOI ID 33020 NHS South Sefton CCG
Merton House

19 January 2017 Stanley Road
Bootle

southseftonccg.foi@nhs.net Merseyside

L20 3DL

Tel: 0151 247 7000

Re: Freedom of Information Request

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding
Continuing Health Care services within NHS South Sefton CCG.

Request/Response:

1. Please provide the name, email address and telephone number for the Senior Continuing
Healthcare Manager for Adults services.

Jo Ryder, Midlands and Lancashire Commissioning Support Unit (MLCSU),
cmcsu.care@nhs.net and 0151 296 7323

2. Please provide the name, email address and telephone number for the Senior Continuing
Healthcare Manager for Children’s services.

Jo Ryder, Midlands and Lancashire Commissioning Support Unit (MLCSU),
cmcsu.care@nhs.net and 0151 296 7323

3. Please provide the name, email address and telephone number for Continuing Healthcare
Clinical Lead/Chief Nurse for Adults services.

Debbie Fagan, Chief Nurse and Quality Officer, southsefton.ccq@nhs.net and 0151 247 7000

4. Please provide the name, email address and telephone number for Continuing Healthcare
Clinical Lead/Chief Nurse for Children’s services.

Debbie Fagan, Chief Nurse and Quality Officer, southsefton.ccg@nhs.net and 0151 247 7000

Chair: Dr Andrew Mimnagh
Chief Officer: Fiona Taylor
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Please provide the name, email address and telephone number for the Head of Commissioning
for Adults services.

Jan Leonard, Chief Officer Redesign and Commissioning, southsefton.ccg@nhs.net and 0151
247 7000

Please provide the name, email address and telephone number for the Head of Commissioning
for Children’s services.

Jan Leonard, Chief Officer Redesign and Commissioning, southsefton.ccg@nhs.net and 0151
247 7000

Please provide the name, email address and telephone number for the Head of Brokerage for
Adults services.

Jo Ryder, Midlands and Lancashire Commissioning Support Unit (MLCSU),
cmcsu.care@nhs.net and 0151 296 7323

Please provide the name, email address and telephone number for the Head of Brokerage for
Children’s services.

Jo Ryder, Midlands and Lancashire Commissioning Support Unit (MLCSU),
cmcsu.care@nhs.net and 0151 296 7323

Please provide the name email address and telephone number for the Quality Manager for
Adults services.

Colette Page, Interim Programme Manager for Quality and Safety, southsefton.ccg@nhs.net
and 0151 247 7000

Please provide the name email address and telephone number for the Quality Manager for
Children’s services.

Brendan Prescott, Deputy Chief Nurse / Head of Quality and Safety,
southsefton.ccg@nhs.net and 0151 247 7000

Please provide details regarding number of Care Packages requiring ventilator or tracheostomy
support within the CCG within the last 12 months for Adults.

NHS South Sefton does not hold this information.

Please provide details regarding number of Care Packages requiring ventilator or tracheostomy
support within the CCG within the last 12 months for Children.

NHS South Sefton does not hold this information.

Chair: Dr Andrew Mimnagh
Chief Officer: Fiona Taylor
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Please provide details regarding the number of patients readmitted to
hospital/residential/inpatient units due to breakdown of Care Package provisions within the
CCG for the past 12 months.

NHS South Sefton does not hold this information.

Please provide details regarding the number of patients referred outside of the CCG due to
lack of complex care provision or breakdown of care package within the past 12 months.

NHS South Sefton does not hold this information.

Please provide details on the number of care packages currently funded by Personal Health
Budgets within the CCG.

NHS South Sefton CCG has 5 care packages currently funded by Personal Health Budgets.

There will also be a number of joint packages of care where individuals are in receipt of direct
payments via local authority. NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information, you may
want to redirect your query to the Provider

Sefton Council
information@sefton.gov.uk
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