
Chair: Dr Andrew  Mimnagh 
Chief Officer: Fiona Taylor 

Re: Freedom of Information Request 

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding breast 
implants within NHS South Sefton CCG. 

Request/Response: 

1) How much has your CCG spent on breast implant removal in the last five years?

Year Cost 

2013/14 £8,380.63 

AINTREE UNIVERSITY HOSPITAL NHS FOUNDATION TRUST £5,579.88 
ROYAL LIVERPOOL AND BROADGREEN UNIVERSITY HOSPITALS 
NHS TRUST £1,175.60 

ST HELENS AND KNOWSLEY HOSPITAL SERVICES NHS TRUST £1,625.15 

2014/15 £15,643.32 

AINTREE UNIVERSITY HOSPITAL NHS FOUNDATION TRUST £12,396.87 
ROYAL LIVERPOOL AND BROADGREEN UNIVERSITY HOSPITALS 
NHS TRUST £3,246.45 

2015/16 £15,247.34 

AINTREE UNIVERSITY HOSPITAL NHS FOUNDATION TRUST £4,193.32 
ROYAL LIVERPOOL AND BROADGREEN UNIVERSITY HOSPITALS 
NHS TRUST £11,054.02 

2016/17 £3,698.99 

AINTREE UNIVERSITY HOSPITAL NHS FOUNDATION TRUST £1,516.53 
ROYAL LIVERPOOL AND BROADGREEN UNIVERSITY HOSPITALS 
NHS TRUST £2,182.46 

TOTAL £42,970.28 

Please note NHS South Sefton CCG did not become a statutory body until 1 April 2013. 
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2) Of that amount, how much was spent on removing PIP implants?  

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information you may wish to redirect your  
query to the providers:- 

 
Aintree University Hospital NHS Foundation Trust  
FOIrequests@aintree.nhs.uk 
 
Royal Liverpool and Broadgreen University Hospitals NHS Trust  
foi@rlbuht.nhs.uk 
 
St Helens and Knowsley Hospital Services NHS Trust  
foirequests@sthk.nhs.uk 

3)  How much has your CCG spent on breast implant surgery in the past five years? 

Year Cost 

2013/14 £13,347.93 

AINTREE UNIVERSITY HOSPITAL NHS FOUNDATION TRUST £8,993.05 

ALDER HEY CHILDREN'S NHS FOUNDATION TRUST £2,100.60 
ROYAL LIVERPOOL AND BROADGREEN UNIVERSITY 
HOSPITALS NHS TRUST £2,254.28 

2014/15 £8,422.82 

AINTREE UNIVERSITY HOSPITAL NHS FOUNDATION TRUST £8,422.82 

2015/16 £8,187.20 

AINTREE UNIVERSITY HOSPITAL NHS FOUNDATION TRUST £6,236.48 

COUNTESS OF CHESTER HOSPITAL NHS FOUNDATION TRUST £1,950.72 

2016/17 £5,206.07 

AINTREE UNIVERSITY HOSPITAL NHS FOUNDATION TRUST £5,206.07 

TOTAL £35,164.02 

4)  Of that, how many were for psychological reasons and NOT post mastectomy/cancer or 
severe chest trauma? Is it possible to break down why the surgery was carried out on the 
NHS? 

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information you may wish to redirect your query 
to the providers:- 

Aintree University Hospital NHS Foundation Trust  
FOIrequests@aintree.nhs.uk 
 
Royal Liverpool and Broadgreen University Hospitals NHS Trust  
foi@rlbuht.nhs.uk 
 
Alder Hey Children’s NHS Foundation Trust 
Info.gov@alderhey.nhs.uk  
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Countess of Chester Hospital NHS Foundation Trust 
foi.enquiries@nhs.net 

If you are unable to break down Q 4 please concentrate on Qs 1,2&3. 
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