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Re: Freedom of Information Request

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding learning
disability commissioning within NHS South Sefton CCG.

Request/Response:

1.

How many individuals with a learning disability (LD) do you commission a support package
to, and how many of these have an Autistic Spectrum Disorder (ASD)?

9

2. How many individuals with an Autistic Spectrum Disorder (with no associated learning
disability) do you commission a support package for?

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information as the data we currently receive is
not separated by specific diagnosis.

3. What was the cost to the council/CCG of providing supported living for adults with a LD
and/or ASD in supported tenancies in the period from 1st October to 31 December 20177
£147,265

4. What is the average hourly rate currently paid by the council/CCG to support adults with
LD/ASD in their own tenancies?

5. What is the highest hourly rate currently paid by the council/CCG to support adults with
LD/ASD in their own tenancies?

6. Do you have a framework of accredited providers you use to commission supported living
for adults with LD and/or ASD?

7. Do you commission any providers to support adults with LD/ASD who are not on this
framework, and if so how many?

8. When does the current contract expire and if there are there any extension periods, what
are these?

9. What are the names and business addresses of the council's contracted LD/ASD supported
living care providers?
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For questions 4 — 9 NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this data you may wish to refer your
guery to Sefton Council

information@sefton.gov.uk
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