
Chair: Dr Andrew Mimnagh 
Chief Officer: Fiona Taylor 

NHS South Sefton CCG 

Merton House 
Stanley Road 

Bootle 
Merseyside 

L20 3DL 

Tel: 0151 317 8456 

Email: southsefton.ccg@nhs.net 

Re: Freedom of Information Request 

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding 
Assessment and Treatment Units within NHS South Sefton CCG. 

Request/Response: 

1. How many ATU's are currently in use in your NHS Trust?

1 

2. How many individuals kept in each one have learning disabilities/autism?

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information; you may wish to refer your query to
Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust.
freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk

3. What are the current age ranges of individuals in the ATU's?

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information; you may wish to refer your query to
Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust.
freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk

4. What is the average length of stay currently?.

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information; you may wish to refer your query to
Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust.
freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk

5. What is the longest any individual is currently being held for?

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information; you may wish to refer your query to
Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust.
freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk
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6. How many individuals have been admitted and sectioned whilst in there since the 2015

report, recommending closure of all such establishments?

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information; you may wish to refer your query to
Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust.
freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk

7. What is the monthly and annual cost for each individual who is detained in these units?

Annual - £136k (estimated)
Monthly – £11.33k (estimated)

8. Who owns the ATU's your Health Care Trust currently uses?

NHS
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