

Our Ref: 54044

17 December 2018

southseftonccg.foi@nhs.net

NHS South Sefton CCG

Merton House
Stanley Road
Bootle
Merseyside
L20 3DL

Tel: 0151 317 8456

Email: southsefton.ccg@nhs.net

Re: Freedom of Information Request

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding Out-of-Hours within NHS South Sefton CCG.

Request/[Response](#):

1. Please tell me if the CCG is responsible for commissioning out-of-hours services within the area?

[Yes](#)

2. If yes, approximately what is the size of the population covered?

[168000](#)

3. Please tell me how many GPs are on duty on a typical weekday night shift (eg Wednesday 5th/Thurs 6th December) between the hours of 6.30pm and 8am?

[NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information. You may wish to redirect your query to –](#)

[GoToDoc Healthcare Limited - http://www.gtdhealthcare.co.uk/](#)

4. Please tell me how many GPs are on duty on a typical weekend day shift (eg Saturday 8th December) between the hours of 8am and 6.30pm?

[NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information. You may wish to redirect your query to –](#)

[GoToDoc Healthcare Limited - http://www.gtdhealthcare.co.uk/](#)

5. Please tell me how many GPs are on duty on a typical weekend night shift (eg Saturday 8th/Sunday 9th December) between the hours of 6.30pm and 8am?

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information. You may wish to redirect your query to –

GoToDoc Healthcare Limited - <http://www.gtdhealthcare.co.uk/>

6. Please tell me how many nurses or nurse practitioners are on duty on a typical weekday night shift (eg Wednesday 5th/Thurs 6th December) between the hours of 6.30pm and 8am?

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information. You may wish to redirect your query to –

GoToDoc Healthcare Limited - <http://www.gtdhealthcare.co.uk/>

7. Please tell me how many nurses or nurse practitioners are on duty on a typical weekend day shift (eg Saturday 8th December) between the hours of 8am and 6.30pm?

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information. You may wish to redirect your query to –

GoToDoc Healthcare Limited - <http://www.gtdhealthcare.co.uk/>

8. Please tell me how many nurses or nurse practitioners are on duty on a typical weekend night shift (eg Saturday 8th/Sunday 9th December) between the hours of 6.30pm and 8am?

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information. You may wish to redirect your query to –

GoToDoc Healthcare Limited - <http://www.gtdhealthcare.co.uk/>