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Re: Freedom of Information Request

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding eating
disorder services within NHS South Sefton CCG.

Request/Response:

1. Does your CCG fund specialist eating disorder services for people aged 18 and over
(a) in the community and

Yes
(b) as in-patient services?

Inpatient Eating Disorder services for young people and adults are commissioned by
NHS England.

2. Does your CCG fund specialist eating disorder services for children up to the age of 18
(a) in the community and

Yes
(b) as in-patient services?

Inpatient Eating Disorder services for young people and adults are commissioned by
NHS England specialised commissioning

3. If the answer to Request 1a, 1b, 2a and/or 2b is ‘yes’, please supply details of which
providers are commissioned to deliver those services (including those providers
commissioned by NHS England, where the CCG funds specialist in-patient services).

e Young People Community: Alder Hey NHS Foundation Trust

e Adult Community: Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust

e Young People Inpatient: Cheshire & Wirral Partnership NHS Foundation Trust
e Adult Inpatient: Cheshire & Wirral Partnership NHS Foundation Trust
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4.

6.
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If the answer to Request 1a, 1b, 2a and/or 2b is ‘yes’, please provide details of the specific
age-range which each of those services covers (for instance, if a young persons’ service
goes beyond the age of 18, or if adult services have a upper age limit).

e Young people service is up age 16
e Adult service is 16+ with no upper age limit

If the answer to Information Request 1a, 1b, 2a and/or 2b is ‘yes’, please provide details of
the funding provided for each of those services.

People aged 18 and over

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information for patients within the community
you may wish to forward your query to Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust —
freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information for in-patients, you may wish to
forward your query to NHS England — england.contactus@nhs.net

Children up to the age of 18
Alder Hey NHS Foundation Trust - £96.88k

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information for in-patients, you may wish to
forward your query to Cheshire & Wirral Partnership NHS Foundation Trust -
FOl@cwp.nhs.uk

What is the total population cover by your CCG and within that total what are the estimated
numbers of people
a) under the age of 18 and

31,918

b) over the age of 18?

126,771
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