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Re: Freedom of Information Request 

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding 
community mental health within NHS South Sefton CCG. 

Request/Response: 

1. Do you have a community mental health team in your CCG (or, if applicable, all the CCGs
you represent)?

Yes

2. Do you have specialist community mental health teams in your CCG (or, if applicable, all
the CCGs you represent)?

3. If so, what are they called?

4. How many people have worked in the community mental health team in your CCG (or, if
applicable, all the CCGs you represent) in each calendar year since 2015?

For questions 2-4
NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information. You may wish to refer your query to
Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust –

freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk

5. Do you have a mental health crisis or home treatment team in your CCG (or, if applicable,
all the CCGs you represent)?

Our provider Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust is implementing a Crisis resolution and
home treatment (CRHT) to cover the Trust’s footprint by March 2019.
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6. How many staff have worked in the mental health crisis team in each calendar year since
2015?

7. How many staff have worked in the community mental health team in each calendar year
since 2015?

8. How many people have been assessed by the crisis team in each calendar year since
2015?

9. What is the average time that has elapsed between assessment of a patient by the crisis
team and the community mental health team in each calendar year since 2015?

10. What is the longest time that has elapsed between assessment of a patient by the crisis
team and the community mental health team in each calendar year since 2015?

11. What is the shortest time that has elapsed between assessment of a patient by the crisis
team and the community mental health team in each calendar year since 2015?

For questions 6-11
NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information. You may wish to refer your query to
Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust –

freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk
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