
NHS South Sefton CCG 

Merton House 
Stanley Road 

Bootle 
Merseyside 

L20 3DL 

Tel: 0151 317 8456 

Email: southsefton.ccg@nhs.net 

Re: Freedom of Information Request 

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding IAPT 
services within NHS South Sefton CCG. 

Request/Response: 

1. What was recovery rate within your CCG’s (or, if applicable, all the CCGs on behalf of
whom you respond) IAPT service in each year since 2015?

Financial Year South Sefton CCG 

2015/16 48.0% 

2016/17 40.7% 

2017/18 43.8% 

2018/19 YTD to Dec 46.5% 

2. How many people have been re-referred to IAPT within a year after having moved to
recovery, in each year since 2015 in your CCG (or, if applicable, all the CCGs on behalf of
whom you respond)?

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information, you may wish to refer your query to
NHS Cheshire and Wirral Partnership NHS Foundation Trust – FOI@cwp.nhs.uk

3. How many staff have been employed in the IAPT service in each year since 2015?

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information, you may wish to refer your query to
NHS Cheshire and Wirral Partnership NHS Foundation Trust – FOI@cwp.nhs.uk
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