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Re: Freedom of Information Request 

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding 
Transforming care within NHS South Sefton CCG. 

Request/Response: 

Please provide me with the following information in relation to the enhanced/intensive community 
support service for Adults 

1. When did the above service become operational?

2. The number of patients within your geography who have been referred to the service since

it became operational?

3. Number of patients currently on the waiting list to access the above service?

4. Current waiting time for patients to access the above service?

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information; you may wish to refer your query to

Mersey Care NHS Trust
freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk

Please provide me with the following information in relation to the enhanced/intensive community 
support service for Children 

1. When did the above service become operational?

2. The number of patients within your geography who have been referred to the service since

it became operational?

3. Number of patients currently on the waiting list to access the above service?

4. Current waiting time for patients to access the above service?

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information; you may wish to refer your query to

Alder Hey Children’s NHS Foundation Trust
Info.gov@alderhey.nhs.uk
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Please provide me with the following information in relation to adults and children with learning 
disability/autism from your geographic area who are in mental health or learning disability/autism 
inpatient units:  

1. Average length of stay for children with a learning disability and/or autism in inpatient units

2. Average length of stay for adults with a learning disability and/or autism in inpatient units

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information; you may wish to refer your query to

Mersey Care NHS Trust
freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk

Alder Hey Children’s NHS Foundation Trust
Info.gov@alderhey.nhs.uk
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