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Re: Freedom of Information Request 

Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request regarding Out of 
Area Mental Health placements within NHS South Sefton CCG. 

Request/Response: 

1. For the period 1st January 2017 to 31st  October 2019, how many Out of Area Mental

Health placements did you make.

106 

2. For each of these placements, please state anonymized detail as to:

See attached appendix 1

2.1. How long was the placement initially contracted for? 

Not applicable 

2.2. How many days the placement actually lasted (or length of stay until 31st October 

2019 if ongoing) 

See attached appendix 1 

2.3. How much the placement cost (costs to 31st October 2019 if ongoing) 

See attached appendix 1 

2.4. What was the primary diagnosis of the service user who was placed. 

Not applicable 

2.5. What were the other diagnoses of the service user who was placed. 

Not applicable 
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2.6. Which organisation provided the placement 

See attached appendix 1 

2.7. Was the status of the service user informal or detained under the Mental Health 

Act 

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information 

2.8. On discharge from placement, which local service was the service user referred to 

(if any).  

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information 


