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Re: Freedom of Information Request 
 
Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request on the numbers of 
patients per year who have had an accidental fall within NHS South Sefton CCG. 
 
Request/Response: 
 
The information is requested as numbers per year (from 2010 onwards) on an individual year by 
year basis under the following headings: 
 

1. Number of A&E attendances per year associated with an accidental fall in your CCG 

area. 

South Sefton CCG A&E Attendances Associated with an Accidental Fall by Age by Year 

Year 
Age Bands Grand 

Total 0-17 18-24 25-34 35-44 45-54 55-64 65-74 75-84 85-94 95+ NULL 

2013/14 88 25 33 31 56 65 114 254 211 28 2 907 

2014/15 101 18 45 58 81 137 169 311 341 48 6 1,315 

2015/16 89 29 52 58 111 148 207 383 344 46 2 1,469 

2016/17 97 25 29 62 103 113 210 385 340 42 7 1,413 

2017/18 62 27 52 74 93 175 213 403 404 52 6 1,561 

2018/19 66 39 63 82 125 178 244 495 425 38 3 1,758 
 

This data was sourced from secondary care A&E data and was only available back to 
2013/14.   

 
2. Hospital outpatient appointments per year associated with an accidental fall in your 

CCG area. 

 

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information, you may wish to resend your  

query to the following provider:- 

Liverpool University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust 
FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk 

3. GP appointments per year associated with an accidental fall in your CCG area. 

Our Ref: 66616 
 
1 April 2020 
 
southseftonccg.foi@nhs.net 
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NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information. 

 
4. Number of deaths per year associated with an accidental fall in your CCG area. 

 

South Sefton CCG Number of Deaths Associated with an Accidental Fall by Age by Year 

Year 
Age Bands Grand 

Total 0-17 18-24 25-34 35-44 45-54 55-64 65-74 75-84 85-94 95+ NULL 

2013/14 0 0 0 0 0 0 2 9 4 0 0 15 

2014/15 0 0 0 0 0 0 3 6 11 2 0 22 

2015/16 0 0 0 0 0 1 1 5 5 2 0 14 

2016/17 0 0 0 0 1 1 2 1 6 2 1 14 

2017/18 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 7 9 0 0 17 

2018/19 0 0 0 0 0 1 3 2 4 1 0 11 

 
This data was sourced from secondary care A&E data and was only available back to 
2013/14.  Falls A&E attendances resulting in a patient death is based upon the A&E 
attendance disposal code 10 -  Died in Department 
 

 


