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Dear Mr Cairns 
 
Re: Freedom of Information Request 
 
Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request on the numbers of 
patients per year who have had a fall associated with vision correction within NHS South Sefton 
CCG. 
 
Request/Response: 
 
1. The number of A&E attendances per year for an accidental fall associated with glasses use in 

your CCG area. 

2. The number of hospital outpatient appointments per year for an accidental fall associated with 

glasses use in your CCG area. 

For questions 1 – 2 NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information, you may wish to 
resend your query to the following provider:- 
 
Liverpool University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust 
FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk 

 
3. The number of GP appointments per year for an accidental fall associated with glasses use in 

your CCG area. 

NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information.  

 
4. The number of deaths per year for an accidental fall associated with glasses use in your CCG 

area. 

For questions 1 – 2 NHS South Sefton CCG does not hold this information, you may wish to 
resend your query to the following provider:- 
 
Liverpool University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust 
FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk 
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